



Item #	DESCRIPTION	UOM	MWI-Boise, ID		APEXX-Englewood, CO		HENRY SCHEIN- DUBLIN, OH	
			EACH PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	EACH PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	EACH PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
1	Tuttnauer EZ11 Plus Automatic Autoclave	1 ea	\$ 4,313.33	\$ 4,313.33	\$ 4,850.00	\$ 5,100.00	\$ 5,064.15	\$ 5,064.15
2	Autoclave tape	1case	\$ 3.58	\$ 42.93	\$ 249.00	\$ 264.00	\$3.20ea (115.20)	115.20/cs of 36 roll
3	Tuttnauer Ultrasonic Cleaning Systems 1 gal w/heater	1 ea	\$ 554.44	\$ 554.44	\$ 649.00	\$ 684.00	\$ 620.00	\$ 620.00
4	Centrifuges	1 ea	322.22/613.33	\$ 935.55	\$ 4,995.00	\$ 5,040.00	\$ 1,099.00	\$ 1,099.00
5	Dental Machine	1ea	\$ 4,192.39	\$ 4,192.39	\$ 3,995.00	\$ 4,170.00	\$ 5,240.00	\$ 5,240.00
6	Adjustable V-Top Table adjusts to flat, hydraulic base, stainless steel	1 ea	\$ 2,274.67	\$ 2,274.67	\$ 3,349.00	\$ 3,774.00	\$ 2,721.00	\$ 2,721.00
7	Quick release tie-down Cleat	4 sets	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	NO BID	NO BID	n/a	n/a
8	Veterinary Table Rails	8 ea	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	NO BID	NO BID	call for info	
9	WAHL Lithium Pro	2 ea	\$ 58.31	\$ 116.62	\$ 55.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 164.87	\$ 329.74
10	WAHL Blades 40-30	2 ea	\$ 13.31	\$ 26.62	\$ 25.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 38.00	\$ 76.00
11	Wet Table w/drawers	1 ea	\$ 2,335.11	\$ 2,335.11	\$ 3,950.00	\$ 4,270.00	\$ 3,225.69	\$ 3,225.69
12	DRE Maxx Luxx LED - Single Ceiling Mount	1 ea	\$ 3,083.11	\$ 3,083.11	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 2,626.16	\$ 2,626.16
13	Sentinel-V 3025i Veterinary Vital Signs Monitor from Leading Edge	3 ea	\$ 4,009.56	\$ 12,031.37	\$ 3,195.00	\$ 9,660.00	\$ 6,786.18	\$ 20,358.54
14	Supera Pureline® M6000 Anesthesia Delivery System	2 ea	\$ 2,354.17	\$ 4,708.34	\$ 4,395.00	\$ 8,955.00	\$ 3,895.67	\$7791.34+\$410 ship
15	Tec 3 Isoflurane Vaporizer from Leading Edge	2 ea	LANDMARK INCLUDES VAPORIZOR		\$ 995.00	\$ 2,030.00	\$ 797.83	\$ 1,595.66
16	Respiration Monitor	1 ea	\$ 180.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 497.00	\$ 518.00	n/a	n/a
17	ART-E1 Electrosurgery Unit (ESU)	1 ea	\$ 633.33	\$ 633.33	\$ 585.00	\$ 605.00	\$ 664.00	\$ 664.00
18	IV Poles - Economy style	3 ea	\$ 29.17	\$ 87.50	\$ 59.00	\$ 217.00	\$ 49.99	\$ 149.97
19	Heska Vet/IV 2.2 Infusion Pump	3 ea	\$ 1,109.69	\$ 3,329.07	\$ 1,495.00	\$ 4,530.00	\$ 1,030.00	\$ 3,090.00
20	KLAW Cage Mount IV Pole - Stainless Steel	2 ea	\$ 137.78	\$ 275.56	\$ 179.00	\$ 388.00	n/a	n/a
21	Revolution III Microscope from Leading Edge	1 ea	\$ 666.67	\$ 666.67	\$ 575.00	\$ 620.00	\$ 1,099.00	\$ 1,099.00



22	Microscope Cleaning Kit from Leading Edge	1 ea	\$ 19.44	\$ 19.44	\$ 39.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 75.30	\$ 75.30
23	Welch Allyn 3.5v Pneumatic Otoscope (20260)	1 ea	\$ 473.61	\$ 473.61	\$ 549.00	\$ 554.00	\$ 155.00	\$ 155.00
24	Refractometer	2 ea	\$ 49.88	\$ 99.76	\$ 89.00	\$ 183.00	\$ 141.20	\$ 282.40
25	Test Tube Rack	5 ea	\$ 300.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 46.10	\$ 230.50
26	3.0 Endo Tube, 180mm long	3 ea	\$ 1.29	\$ 3.87	\$ 8.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 1.44	\$ 4.32
27	3.5 Endo Tube, 210mm long	3 ea	\$ 1.29	\$ 3.87	\$ 8.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 1.44	\$ 4.32
28	4.0 Endo Tube, 220mm long	3 ea	\$ 1.29	\$ 3.87	\$ 8.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 1.44	\$ 4.32
29	4.5 Endo Tube, 230mm long	3 ea	\$ 1.29	\$ 3.87	\$ 8.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 1.44	\$ 4.32
30	5.0 Endo Tube, 260mm long	3 ea	\$ 1.29	\$ 3.87	\$ 8.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 1.44	\$ 4.32
31	5.5 Endo Tube, 280mm long	3 ea	\$ 1.29	\$ 3.87	\$ 8.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 1.44	\$ 4.32
32	6.0 Endo Tube, 290mm long	3 ea	\$ 1.29	\$ 3.87	\$ 8.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 1.44	\$ 4.32
33	6.5 Endo Tube, 310mm long	3 ea	\$ 1.29	\$ 3.87	\$ 8.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 1.44	\$ 4.32
34	7.0 Endo Tube, 320mm long	3 ea	\$ 1.29	\$ 3.87	\$ 8.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 1.44	\$ 4.32
35	7.5 Endo Tube, 330mm long	3 ea	\$ 1.29	\$ 3.87	\$ 8.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 1.44	\$ 4.32
36	8.0 Endo Tube, 340mm long	3 ea	\$ 1.29	\$ 3.87	\$ 8.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 1.44	\$ 4.32
37	8.5 Endo Tube, 340mm long	3 ea	\$ 1.29	\$ 3.87	\$ 8.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 1.44	\$ 4.32
38	9.0 Endo Tube, 340mm long	3 ea	\$ 1.29	\$ 3.87	\$ 8.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 1.44	\$ 4.32
39	9.5 Endo Tube, 340mm long	3 ea	\$ 1.29	\$ 3.87	\$ 8.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 1.44	\$ 4.32
40	10.0 Endo Tube, 340mm long	3 ea	\$ 1.29	\$ 3.87	\$ 8.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 1.44	\$ 4.32