

OFFICE OF PURCHASING
October 20, 2017
SEALED BID TABULATION



Purchasing Agent: Jaye Latch (903) 237-1324
BID Number: 1718-02 Fleet Vehicles

Bidder			Stanley Ford Gilmer, TX		Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell, TX	
ITEM	QTY	DESCRIPTION	EACH	TOTAL	EACH	TOTAL
1	1	FULL SIZE SEDAN	\$23,263.00	\$23,263.00	\$21,188.00	\$21,188.00
2A	6	UTILITY VEHICLE, 4 DOOR, FULL SIZE, FWD, PPV	\$28,408.00	\$56,816.00	\$30,992.00	\$185,952
2B	1	UTILITY VEHICLE, 4 DOOR, FULL SIZE, FWD, PPV	\$28,408.00	\$28,408.00	\$31,720.00	\$31,720.00
3	1	UTILITY VEHICLE, 4 DOOR, AWD, FULL, PPV (EXPLORER)	\$28,408.00	\$28,408.00	\$26,940.00	\$26,940.00
4	1	FULL SIZE ¾ TON, REGULAR CAB AND CHASSIS	\$28,870.00	\$28,870.00	No Bid	No Bid
5	3	½ TON EXTENDED CAB PICKUP TRUCK W/SHORT BED	\$26,986.00	\$80,958.00	\$22,310.00	\$66,930.00
6	1	½ TON CREW CAB PICK UP WITH SHORT BED	\$29,516.00	\$29,516.00	\$24,845.00	\$24,845.00
7	2	CARGO VAN 4 CYLINDER FWD	\$23,972.00	\$47,944.00	No Bid	No Bid
8	1	¾ TON PICKUP EXTENDED CAB WITH UTILITY BODY	\$36,009.00	\$36,009.00	\$31,225.00	\$31,225.00
9	1	ONE TON DUALY, CREW CAB, LONG BED	\$40,518.00	\$40,518.00	\$37,125.00	\$37,125.00
10	3	½ TON EXTENDED CAB PICK UP WITH LONG BED	\$28,668.00	\$86,004.00	No Bid	No Bid
11	1	1 TON EXTENDED CAB DUALY PICKUP WITH UTILITY BODY	\$35,462.00	\$35,462.00	\$34,270.00	\$34,270.00
12	1	UTILITY VEHICLE, MID SIZE, 4 DOOR, FWD	\$30,880.00	\$30,880.00	\$24,710.00	\$24,710.00
13	1	UTILITY VEHICLE, COMPACT, 4 DOOR	\$21,981.00	\$21,981.00	\$18,920.00	\$18,920.00

Bidder			Pegues-Hurst Motor Company Longview, TX		Randall Reed's Prestige Ford Garland, TX	
ITEM	QTY	DESCRIPTION	EACH	TOTAL	EACH	TOTAL
1	1	FULL SIZE SEDAN	\$18,999.00	\$18,999.00	\$21,700.00	\$21,700.00
			\$22,999.00	\$22,999.00		
2A	6	UTILITY VEHICLE, 4 DOOR, FULL SIZE, FWD, PPV	No Bid		\$28,000.00	\$168,000.00
2B	1	UTILITY VEHICLE, 4 DOOR, FULL SIZE, FWD, PPV	No Bid		\$28,000.00	\$28,000.00
3	1	UTILITY VEHICLE, 4 DOOR, AWD, FULL, PPV (EXPLORER)	\$29,500.00	\$29,500.00	\$28,400.00	\$28,400.00
					\$28,100.00	\$28,100.00
4	1	FULL SIZE ¾ TON, REGULAR CAB AND CHASSIS	\$23,400.00	\$23,400.00	\$23,400.00	\$23,400.00
5	3	½ TON EXTENDED CAB PICKUP TRUCK W/SHORT BED	\$21,800.00	\$65,400.00	\$23,550.00	\$70,650.00
					\$22,200.00	\$66,600.00
6	1	½ TON CREW CAB PICK UP WITH SHORT BED	\$26,600.00	\$26,600.00	\$26,640.00	\$26,640.00
7	2	CARGO VAN 4 CYLINDER FWD	\$22,300.00	\$44,600.00	\$21,400.00	\$21,400.00
8	1	¾ TON PICKUP EXTENDED CAB WITH UTILITY BODY	\$30,990.00	\$30,990.00	\$31,300.00	\$31,300.00
9	1	ONE TON DUALY, CREW CAB, LONG BED	\$43,000.00	\$43,000.00	\$38,100.00	\$38,100.00
10	3	½ TON EXTENDED CAB PICK UP WITH LONG BED	\$26,250.00	\$78,750.00	\$24,860.00	\$74,580.00
11	1	1 TON EXTENDED CAB DUALY PICKUP WITH UTILITY BODY	\$36,250.00	\$36,250.00	\$36,660.00	\$36,660.00
			\$36,250.00	\$36,250.00		
12	1	UTILITY VEHICLE, MID SIZE, 4 DOOR, FWD	\$25,990.00	\$25,990.00	\$25,980.00	\$25,980.00
13	1	UTILITY VEHICLE, COMPACT, 4 DOOR	\$19,500.00	\$19,500.00	\$19,600.00	\$19,600.00

Bidder			Silsbee Ford Silsbee, TX		Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Grapevine, TX	
ITEM	QTY	DESCRIPTION	EACH	TOTAL	EACH	TOTAL
1	1	FULL SIZE SEDAN	\$21,492.00	\$21,492.00	\$21,673.00	\$21,673.00
2A	6	UTILITY VEHICLE, 4 DOOR, FULL SIZE, FWD, PPV	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2B	1	UTILITY VEHICLE, 4 DOOR, FULL SIZE, FWD, PPV	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	1	UTILITY VEHICLE, 4 DOOR, AWD, FULL, PPV (EXPLORER)	\$27,491.00	\$27,491.00	No Bid	No Bid
4	1	FULL SIZE ¾ TON, REGULAR CAB AND CHASSIS	\$22,869.00	\$22,869.00	\$23,726.00	\$23,726.00
					\$23,246.00	\$23,246.00
5	3	½ TON EXTENDED CAB PICKUP TRUCK W/SHORT BED	\$24,491.00	\$73,473.00	\$22,119.00	\$66,357.00
6	1	½ TON CREW CAB PICK UP WITH SHORT BED	\$26,649.00	\$26,649.00	\$25,411.00	\$25,411.00
7	2	CARGO VAN 4 CYLINDER FWD	\$22,379.00	\$44,758.00	\$21,355.00	\$42,710.00
8	1	¾ TON PICKUP EXTENDED CAB WITH UTILITY BODY	\$30,941.00	\$30,941.00	\$34,379.00	\$34,379.00
9	1	ONE TON DUALY, CREW CAB, LONG BED	\$37,882.00	\$37,882.00	\$35,234.00	\$35,234.00
10	3	½ TON EXTENDED CAB PICK UP WITH LONG BED	\$25,792.00	\$77,376.00	No Bid	No Bid
11	1	1 TON EXTENDED CAB DUALY PICKUP WITH UTILITY BODY	\$36,097.00	\$36,097.00	\$35,664.00	\$35,664.00
12	1	UTILITY VEHICLE, MID SIZE, 4 DOOR, FWD	\$25,992.00	\$25,992.00	\$24,981.00	\$24,981.00
					\$25,781.00	\$25,781.00
13	1	UTILITY VEHICLE, COMPACT, 4 DOOR	\$19,949.00	\$19,949.00	\$20,784.00	\$20,784.00

Bidder			Peters Chevrolet Inc. Longview, TX	
ITEM	QTY	DESCRIPTION	EACH	TOTAL
1	1	FULL SIZE SEDAN	\$21,835.00	No extended listed
2A	6	UTILITY VEHICLHLE, 4 DOOR, FULL SIZE, FWD, PPV	\$28,170.00	No extended listed
2B	1	UTILITY VEHICLE, 4 DOOR, FULL SIZE, FWD, PPV	\$28,170.00	No extended listed
3	1	UTILITY VEHICLE, 4 DOOR, AWD, FULL, PPV (EXPLORER)	\$29,507.75	No extended listed
4	1	FULL SIZE ¾ TON, REGULAR CAB AND CHASSIS	\$23,767.75	No extended listed
5	3	½ TON EXTENDED CAB PICKUP TRUCK W/SHORT BED	\$21,552.75	No extended listed
6	1	½ TON CREW CAB PICK UP WITH SHORT BED	\$25,022.75	No extended listed
7	2	CARGO VAN 4 CYLINDER FWD	No Bid Submitted	No Bid Submitted
8	1	¾ TON PICKUP EXTENDED CAB WITH UTILITY BODY	\$24,722.75	No extended listed
9	1	ONE TON DUALY, CREW CAB, LONG BED	\$36,478.00	No extended listed
10	3	½ TON EXTENDED CAB PICK UP WITH LONG BED	\$25,198.75	No extended listed
11	1	1 TON EXTENDED CAB DUALY PICKUP WITH UTILITY BODY	\$37,943.75	No extended listed
12	1	UTILITY VEHICLE, MID SIZE, 4 DOOR, FWD	\$24,536.75	No extended listed
13	1	UTILITY VEHICLE, COMPACT, 4 DOOR	\$19,167.75	No extended listed

*Offers listed herein tabulated were received as of the bid opening date. All other offers are declared non-responsive and are hereby rejected