



Bidder			Randall Reed's Prestige Ford Garland, TX		Peters Chrysler JDRF Longview, TX		Pegues-Hurst Motor Company Longview, TX	
ITEM	QTY	DESCRIPTION	EACH	TOTAL	EACH	TOTAL	EACH	TOTAL
1	2	Full Size Sedan	\$21,300.00	\$42,600.00	\$23,110.75	\$46,221.50	\$17,368.00	\$34,736.00
2	18	Utility Vehicle, 4 door, Full Size, PPV, Two Wheel Drive	No Bid	No Bid	\$31,927.75	\$574,699.50	No Bid	No Bid
3	3	½ Ton Full Size Extended Cab Pickup Truck w/short bed	\$23,430.00	\$70,290.00	\$24,267.15	\$72,801.45	\$22,368.00	\$67,104.00
4	1	Utility Vehicle, Light Duty, Compact, 4 Door	\$19,450.00	\$19,450.00	\$22,841.75	\$22,841.75	\$18,611.00	\$18,611.00
5	1	Commercial Mini Van (5 Passenger)	\$23,500.00	\$23,500.00	\$23,264.75	\$23,264.75	\$22,806.00	\$22,806.00
6	1	¾ Ton Full Size Pickup extended Cab (minimum) w/ Short Bed	\$25,750.00	\$25,750.00	\$25,887.55	\$25,887.55	\$27,000.00	\$27,000.00

Bidder			Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell, TX		Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Grapevine, TX		Sport City Toyota Dallas, TX	
ITEM	QTY	DESCRIPTION	EACH	TOTAL	EACH	TOTAL	EACH	TOTAL
1	2	Full Size Sedan	\$21,575.00	\$43,150.00	\$23,619.00	\$47,238.00	\$20,525.00	\$41,050.00
2	18	Utility Vehicle, 4 door, Full Size, PPV, Two Wheel Drive	\$30,940.00	\$556,920.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$32,500.00	\$585,000.00
3	3	½ Ton Full Size Extended Cab Pickup Truck w/short bed	\$21,645.00	\$64,935.00	\$23,202.00	\$69,606.00	\$27,486.00	\$82,458.00
4	1	Utility Vehicle, Light Duty, Compact, 4 Door	\$21,382.00	\$21,382.00	\$20,257.00	\$20,257.00	\$20,594.00	\$20,594.00
5	1	Commercial Mini Van (5 Passenger)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$28,768.00	\$28,768.00
6	1	¾ Ton Full Size Pickup extended Cab (minimum) w/ Short Bed	\$26,990.00	\$26,990.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

\*Offers listed herein tabulated were received as of the bid opening date. All other offers are declared non-responsive and are hereby rejected